
 

 TOWNSHIP OF UPPER DEERFIELD 
 
 RESOLUTION # 11-147 
 

AUTHORIZING AWARDING CONTRACT FOR PROVIDING YEARLY FIRE 
EXTINGUISHER MAINTENANCE 

 
           WHEREAS, the Township of Upper Deerfield requested proposals with respect to providing 
yearly maintenance to fire extinguishers and suppression systems within the Township for a term of 
one year beginning July 1, 2011 to June 30, 2012 from ASPE Inc., Dor Fire Equipment LLC, Over the 
Ridge, Inc and Cumberland Fire Protection, LLC; and 
 
 WHEREAS, proposals were received from A.S.P.E., Cumberland Fire Protection LLC, Dor  
Fire Equipment LLC, and Over the Ridge Inc., as follows: 
 

 ASPE Cumb. Fire Dor Fire Over the 
Ridge 

ABC Inspected 8.00 3.50 7.00 5.00 
5 lb. ABC Recharged 36.00 20.00 34.00 32.00 
10lb. ABC Recharged 38.00 28.00 36.00 34.00 
20lb. ABC Recharged 57.00 52.00 55.00 50.00 
5 lb. ABC Hydro & Recharge 51.00 36.00 50.00 48.00 
10 lb. ABC Hydro & Recharge 56.00 44.00 55.00 50.00 
20 lb. ABC Hydro & Recharge 76.00 68.00 75.00 70.00 
2.5 Gal. Water Recharged 30.00 12.00 30.00 25.00 
2.5 Gal. Water Hydrostatic 57.00 28.00 55.00 50.00 
15 lb. CO2 Recharged 55.00 24.00 50.00 45.00 
15lb CO2 Hydro & Recharge 80.00 51.00 75.00 70.00 
New 5 lb. ABC 65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
New 10lb. ABC 90.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
New 20lb. ABC 180.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Class K Recharge 95.00 80.00 No Bid 85.00 
Class K Hydro 125.00 109.00 No Bid 110.00 
Hood System 130.00 58.00 110.00 100.00 
Links Each 26.00 9.5 13.00 11.00 

 
WHEREAS, the Treasurer has reviewed the proposals and determined that the lowest 

responsible proposal was submitted by Cumberland Fire Protection LLC, and  
 
 WHEREAS, the Township Committee of the Township of Upper Deerfield is desirous of 
awarding the contract for providing yearly maintenance to fire extinguishers and suppression systems 
within the Township to Cumberland Fire Protection LLC  as aforesaid. 
 
 NOW THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED by the Township Committee of the Township of 
Upper Deerfield that the proposal of Cumberland Fire Protection LLC for fire extinguisher and 
suppression systems maintenance is hereby accepted, and that the Mayor and Clerk be and are hereby 
authorized to award yearly fire extinguisher and suppression systems maintenance for a term of one 
year beginning July 1, 2011 to June 30, 2012 as noted above for the Township of Upper Deerfield; and  
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED by the Township Committee of the Township of Upper 
Deerfield that a copy of this Resolution shall remain on file with the Clerk of the Township of Upper 
Deerfield and available for public inspection.   



 
Moved By:  Bruce Peterson 

 
 

 

    
Seconded By:   John O’Neill  

 
 

VOTING  In Favor Against Abstain Absent 
James P. Crilley  X    
John L. Daddario     X 
John T. O’Neill, Sr.  X    
Bruce T. Peterson  X    
Scott Smith     X 

 
CERTIFICATION 

 
I hereby certify that the foregoing is a true copy of Resolution adopted by the Township 

Committee of the Township of Upper Deerfield, in the County of Cumberland, at a meeting thereof held 
June 16, 2011. 

 
_____________________________ 
Roy J. Spoltore, Township Clerk 
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